
3. CORRESPONDENCE

3.1 SAND DUNES REPORT

A letter was received from the North New Brighton Residents’ Association
expressing concern at the integrity of the wave height run-up report
undertaken by the City and Regional Council.  Concern was also expressed
at the state of some sand dunes in the North New Brighton area, which were
impinging onto the roadway.  The Board decided:

1. To receive the letter.

2. That the Residents’ Association’s concerns be noted and that the letter
be referred to the City Council and Regional Council for comment.

3.2 GRANT

A letter was received from Christine Boyd, Ouruhia Residents’ Association
thanking the Board for its funding for legal bills.  The Board received the
letter.

3.3 HOYTS HERITAGE WEEK (17-23 OCTOBER 1998)

A letter was received from Mr Paul Collins, Co-ordinator of Heritage Week,
outlining the programme for the 1998 Heritage Week, and inviting Board
participation in organising events for the official programme.   The Board
decided to investigate the adoption of a Heritage Week programme for the
future through its Heritage Working Party.

3.4 NEW BRIGHTON PIER - PROPOSED HELICOPTER OPERATION

A letter was received from Mr Robin McCarthy, Aviation Activities Ltd,
requesting Board support for the operation of a helicopter from the end of
New Brighton Pier.  The Board decided:

1. To recommend to the Parks and Recreation Committee that the Pier
Liaison Team’s views be taken into account, and that the helicopter
operator be advised that this activity does not fit in with current Pier or
residential activities.

2. That the Board does not support the helicopter operation proposal in
the Bottle Lake Forest Park Reserve.

3.5 DAYCARE CENTRE - PARKLANDS COMMUNITY

A letter was received from Kieran O’Hagan, Chairman Parklands Christian
Activities Trust Project Management Team, requesting Board support for
the establishment of a daycare centre in Parklands.  The Board decided that
the Property Manager be requested to make provision for the funding of a
creche in Parklands in the 1999/2000 financial year and to identify
appropriate sites, and that the Parklands Project Team be asked to report the
results back to the Board.



3.6 TRAVIS/WAINONI ROADS RING ROAD LINK

A letter was received from the Secretary of the Bexley Residents’
Association requesting confirmation that the land currently designated for
Stage II of the Woolston/Burwood Expressway be retained for this purpose.
The Board decided:

1. That the letter be received and forwarded to the City Services
Committee, with the Board’s support for a response on the future
provision of funding for Stage II of the Woolston/Burwood
Expressway.

2. That the Community Manager arrange a meeting with the Chairman of
the City Services Committee, the Chairman of the Burwood/Pegasus
Community Board, the Bexley Residents’ Association and appropriate
officers to get an understanding on the issues of concern to the Bexley
Residents’ Association.

3.7 AVONSIDE DRIVE - ROAD SAFETY

A letter was received from Kathy Reese, President Avon Toy Library,
expressing safety concerns on Avonside Drive in light of a serious accident,
which recently injured a member of the Toy Library.  The Board decided
that the letter be referred to officers for a report, with a view to a meeting
with the Avon Toy Library on receipt of that report.

3.8 BURWOOD PLAYCENTRE

A letter was received from the Secretary of the Burwood Playcentre
requesting Board support for the Playcentre to meet the need to have two
extra car parks as per its Resource Consent conditions.  The Board decided
that officers be requested to prepare a report investigating a cost sharing
scheme for the proposed car parks.


